Kansas City, Kansas Public Schools

2010 N. 59" St.  Kansas City, KS 66104
(913) 551-3200  Fax: (913) 551-3217
www.kckps.org

KANSAS CITY
KANSAS
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

MEMORANDUM

TO : THE KANSAS CITY BOARD OF EDUCATION
FROM : Dr. Cynthia Lane, Superintendent of Schools
DATE : September 13, 2011

SUBJECT: ACCEPT LOW BIDS FOR BUILDING ADDTION AT
T.A. EDISON ELMENTARY SCHOOL.

RECOMMENDATION:

That the Kansas City Board of Education accepts the low bids as identified on the attached
bid recap from various contractors for the building addition to T.A. Edison Elementary
School in the total amount of $5,698,965.00 as submitted by Robert Young, Director of
Purchasing, Dr. Kelli Mather, Chief Financial Officer and as recommended by Dr. Cynthia
Lane, Superintendent of Schools.

EXPLANATION:

Sealed bids were opened for the various aspects of construction work to be performed at T.A.
Edison Elementary School on August 17,2011 at 2:00 p.m. in the Board of Education
Auditorium, 3™ floor, Central Office and District Training Center Building. Bids were
opened on thirty-one (31) bid packages for specific contract work that will go into the
renovation/addition at the elementary school site. Square foot cost came in below the original
engineer’s estimate. A bid tabulation is attached.

The bids have been reviewed and recommended by the District’s general contractor.
Alternates to be accepted as a part of this recommendation are listed on the attachment.

Copies of these letters are attached.
Submi ed’bQ
£

/Cynthia Lane Dr. Kelli Mather

Superintendent of Schools C%noial Officer
Rdbe Yourig 2(

Director of Purcfiasing

Regpmmended

Unified District 500



6864 West 153" Street
QOverland Park, Kansas 66223
Phone (913) 685-1313
Facsimile {913) 685-1311

Construction Grou p, Inc.

Kansas City Kansas Public Schools SEPTEMBER 2, 2011

Unified School District 500
2010 N 59" Street

Kansas City, KS 66104
ATTN: Dr. Kelli Mather

RE: Contract Revision
Thomas A. Edison Elementary School Project

Dear Dr. Mather,

Enclosed, please find the Final Budget for the TA Edison Elementary Project.

The original budget was base upon architectural estimates was 5,126,695 or

After the bidding process the final budget is $ 5,698,965, with an overall Square Foot cost of 218.54
$/SF. | have enclosed the overall estimate breakdown as well as the bid tabulation sheet with all of the

sub bids

Currently the project is over budget by $ 572, 211. | have enclosed a comparison of the Budget vs. the
Actual Cost. We are actually within the SF cost of the Budget

Budget
22,000.00
1,127.00
221,00

SF New Addition
SF Lobby Renovations
SF Modify Mechanical rooms

23,348.00

$5,126,695.00
216.58

Actual
1,084.00
517.00
20,551.00
3,852.00

Budgeted Square Footage

Estimated Cost
S/SF Estimated Cost

Office Addition

Storage Room Addition
Classroom Addition
Interior Renovations

26,104.00

$ 5,698,965.00
218.32

Total Actual Square Footage

Actual Budget
$.SF Final Costs

Design/Build

General Contractors

Construction Managers



Construction Group, Inc.

At your earliest convenience, | would love to sit down and review the entire project with both you and
your team to discuss the next step.

Thank you for the opportunity
Respectfully,

Z V.

Brad Oliver
Kelly Construction Group



BID DAY TA EDHSION

SUBCONTRACTOR

BASE BID

Add Payment and
Performance Bond

ALT#1

J& ]

5 - - R R
S - -
..... Move Modelar Clnssropy - 02070 S TR Badged i 0
§ - 5
RTINS Robeerd T
Robenet] 5 $ -
5 o X
SHLEy - RL Dttt - L e
b s T
:Earthwork: - R P E T S RE; Duncas] v BRE
----- o RLDemcan] § 134600 [ 5 - -
2230 Kaw Vatloy Companics] § 179.300] S -
George Shaw] 8 156309 5 - -
Bluc Moon Hauling] § 1620000 5 - -
Blue Moon Haoling / Sqe Unlities) § 245080 | & .
s I
i A Toraahls POat Comtrel] ik | 0
o Affordible Pest Control] S 1500] 8 - - - .
Bear Sences] § 23201 % - - - -
Lawnrence Pest cortrol] § 2500 5 - - - -
5 - 13 - - -
Slepe Prgtection and Erosion Comwrol - 52379 - s RE Dameenl 2 s L 0 e )
2 Erosion Cortzel / Incorporated] § 13599 & - 500 00 - -
SWFP M nngl § 3800 § - - - -
5 - 18 - - - -
5 . 5 - - -
2o DEpEg: s MGl o R R i e g ) i e
h 530, 02630 McGamahi] § 86,092 | § 2,700.00 - - -
Rainbow Construstion] § 109,508 | $ 3.818.78 - - -
Blug Moon Hauling / Site Utitities] § MB000 | § - 4,840 00 - - -
5 - 13 I - -
5 o X - - -
- 5 TS . - B
1 i R o S0
5 s N N ”
Seal-0) Matig Pavieg] $ 19586 5 - - -
Latle jocs] § 133977] § - .
5 R
- Gentge Shaw KOG o oo R .0
5 - 18 - -
s Comentintial Bleel] 1 - LG S
5 N k] - -
REILT: S 1 B 3
§ e - - -
L’g}’ezm ROl BAEe R PN cuof) i S
US Feace] § 14089 $ - 400.00 - - -
ACME] § 14,720 f 5 - 775.00 - - -
S - |3 - - - - -
s Curby's Lawa] s R Pavy REITE 8 B g
Curby's Lawn] § 45,163 5 - 803.26 - -
Greea kaven Sod] 5 3,500 5 750.00 - - -
Arbor Master] § 16,0009 § 920.C0 - + -
H b K - - -
i Cushy's Lawe] s s GG il
3 - $ B N -
2t Cesby's Lawal : U g LG o L
§ - 15 - - -
"B Horrmed o L e e 3500
8BS Hardsea 5 195140 § - 780.58 - - 3,500
I S L K3 e - - -
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BID DAY- TA EDISION

SPEC

BASE BiD

Add Payment and
Performance Bond

ALT#1

Add Energy
‘'Recovery
Wheel .

$ - {3 - - -
D 33884 Greiorge Shan AKCGE s [ L ADD4T2 TR R e
George Shaw F KCG] S 200598 | § 2,507.00 250 -
Intee £ i s 444,600 § - No Bid -
J1 Maniny] § 498,000 | $ -2,200 -
Leaveon] § 557050 | & -275 -
5 L K
oo Loncrete: Reba . R i Cottar Witters S0 teas] L T e T
Midswest Steel Fabntators 38 Tons) § 45806 1 5 - - - -
Midwest - Reinforcing! WWF] $ - -
Migwest - Reinforetng Masonny| 3 - -
Carter Waters 50 tonsf § 50,3461 3 - -
LW Reinforcing! WWF] 29,851 | § - -
CW Remforimg Masonnd § 0485 8 - -
Gerdaa 55 tons] § 55,8611 S - -
H - S
Goorge Sheat J KOG 0 | s
$ - $ - -
S - $
- Omega Conorzie Syateme] 500 o 50
Omcpa Concraie Systems] § 288500 | § 5,400.00 - - - -
Cors Sleb & S M53821 % 2,650.00 - - - -

- 313

D& D Masonyf S 4449001 5 6,400.00 - - -1,100 -
Just BalToud & 470,208 | § 7.928.00 - - 1,120 -
MGM Masonry] § 486370 S 13,898.00 B - . "
TRI STATE MASONRY] § soE530 | 3 10,400.00 - - - -
Swmnmit Masonn] $ sa0800f § - 5.700.00 - - - -
Precigioh Masonry] S 494044 | & 14.061.00
Trio Masoray] § 549,760 | § - §,300.00
b - $ - - -
L DB D Mssesnv] L wiDi i s

; Contengintial SiigH] .

355,018

- Inel -

Constriction (riiip]

Contontintial Steel] 5
Dioing Steel Fabrcation] S 3594861 8 538220
Structural Metal of KCJ 8 368.800] 8 §,800.00
Kansas city Stucteral} § 320011 $ - 3,726.00 - - - -
Buiiders Sweel] 8 116480 § 4,100.00 - - - -
Lico Stzcl] § 416,500 | S 7,10000 - - - .
3 M M N
e Seel ot T BEZNg - Commmtial S] e o 0 5
Liteet Beck ST - Gorteativial ol B o 0 T
S - 3 -
. .- 05488 e Coons| 370 (D S Qo
5 T 5 ; .
- §5380° Kelly Conatruction Group] ... 1,880 50 0] B AR 0 R
Sipains] § 28115 - - - - - -
Mays Maund] § 965 ] $ . . B - -
InProf § 201 S - - - - B
13 . 3 - . . - .
5 e - - -

ASIGHT| . . B N .
Kelly Construction Grougf § 45607 | S - - - hd -
5 - |5 - - -
- o - Einished Carpent B - Kelly Construction Groapl 0000 o 0 T o
Ketly conszraction Grozpf S 29658 | § - - - - N
s . Is j j . B B
5 N - N .
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BID DAY TA EDMSION

ALT#1
Add Payment and
Performance Bon Recovery
Sl Wheel
SPEC
SECTI
SUBCONTRACTORf BASE BID
5 - S - - -
Ll Avlied Mewbran R et 0 O
T a5, 07920, 17840, 02764 ool s 38g5t]S D - -
7920,7196, 02764 DHR inz] 8 3646408 - - - - B47.00 0 - -
7920719 Larkiz] § 42665 § €40.00 0 - -
S ) A R R
i f T IT o Tog Coops] o R SO
T ~ s ) - . N
. Melol Wall, sofitand BeplLRanals - 87412 T R i R g g
_______________ s T Ts " " B
:-"“--“"“.“__f__““" e ﬂ&g - S BELTAL] S PRSI ot KRR} BN B
D35S0, 07412, 0751507620, 07720, 10705 pELTA | s s3na24]s 8,102.00 . - .
17412, 07513,07620, 07720 KAW] S 187005 - - - -
07442, 07515,07620, 07720 Corae!l Rocling] § 593350 | S 8,885.00 - * -
- - " W — P— s - s - - .
Abeet Metal Work 0 D766 s DELTAE 0 Abave g Qo O e
DELTA Above 3 - - - -
KAW| Above 5 - - - -
Cornell Rogfing Above $ - - - -
07412, 076 Shawhan] § 116910F S - 2.045.00 - - -
07412, 07620, 10708 Standerd Shost Metal] 8 24201357 § - 2,760.60 . - B
5 N R N
gL AETAR e DEGTA e e S0 O
Roof Scuttie DELTA Abeve $ - - -
Roof Hatch KAW, Above 5 - - - -
Ladder Safety Post Comell Roofing] Above 5 - - - - -
Griffin Sales] & 2,133] % - - - -
| Ecton and Associmes] § 16391 & - -
o 5 T Ts B - B
L L R ey JE500 R [EE
Larkin| Abeve S - C - 6.500 - -
Cl s (L ] 513.00 - - -
Commercial Weterproolinef 8 40533 § - - 7.571 - -
DH Rcsmrmmn[ Above 5 - 5,124 - -
Above $

Omeza Doo

B 03100.08210, 08711 Crezallood 60729 |8 . ‘ . .
08100,082149, 08710 DH Pace] S 56495 | $ . . - T
18100,,08210, 08 Metal Docrs ard Framss] § 53,6451 § - - - -
5 - 1s - - -
S—
_meﬂm&;m FASIS <Him Plenke] 5 B B 0 i S
T 5 i . N "
it OmsgaDoarf e L S
s - S - - B
ek Punkenf e s DU 0 S A
JimPlurken] 8 152848 § 1,705.00 - - -
Midwest Glass] § 165885] § - - - - -
Carter Glass] § 240,700 ) S - 4,815.00 - - -
gy s - s - - "
Jim Phanketd - B B Qi DXL I 9
. Omegd Door] 770 B 0 )
Q_&&Q}g i e Plisoa] T | SNE g

i Joz Coong| Sy
7. Joc Coons] 8 11209318 - - - 132000 - . -
}5400, 07200, 09260, 19300 Aflied Construcuon Senvice} S 198500 $ 1,885.00 - - -
5. 0. 204 RESTHA 3679717 § 6,758.00 - - -
5 - $ - - -
- Asoustical Coiline e Cea - o R e
B - . .
s Cpet LT 5 S I ) o
Carper L $ 680.00 - -
§ - 1s - - - -
§ - 13 - - -
Epoxy Coatirg Surfaces] § 15500 F 5 - 4685.00 - - -
Deseo Cogtings] § 22488 § 450,00 - - -
3 T Is - . N T
Carodt ) s Capatd] o T o v —
$ - 3 - - -
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BID DAY- TA EDISION

SPEC
SECTI

SUBCONTRACTOR|

BASE BID

ALT#1

Add Payment and
Performance Bond

ALTHT
Acd Energy
Recovery
Whaet

Novawalil S .

578418 -150.60 -
5 ~ fs R
i Raiating 0G0 ;. Sweerand Asscme] T b Py
Switzer and Associatesf § 335615 1,100.00 -
Lass Coznnv § § 329571 % - 2{0.00 -
AT SWITZER] § W.40] 5 - 77500
Daveo Painting] 8 4,980 5 - 450.00 -
Comrnd s wosls
5 3
by 3 TOTALY FiS
Access Panels CLACO Sepply] 8 - s - - -
Proiection Screen CLACO Supply 3 TOTALY S 3845 5 - B
Siggias2 total] § 3,260 ) 5 - -
s N N
mm@% 10109 s Bigmmpl oo A R
------------------ ) CLACO Supply] Belaw S - -
Sigyinsf § 323751 § - - -
Pletinum] § 9,666 | - -
Mgyerd § 12,675 ] § - -
Midwest Acoustics | § 25425 | & - R
Sorcla] § 3285005 " .
S $ - -
| Tuflct Parrifiony (nolil Povee TIBLED L S ] ; T T
CLACO Sepphy] 8 - 1) - -
Sigpins- Iastalled] 5 7613] 3 - ;A
Mayes- nstatied] § 1914 8 . N
Sorclla- [nstelled] $ 36595 - - -
CLACO Supply- Isstalled] 8 58200 % - - -
Zznes- Not instatied] § 588 - .
MJ Products- installedf S 61208 S - -
5 - {3 -
oo Subicde Cortaip Frack (/10180 Sagme i
__________ CLACO Sepply] § - |5 - -
Siggins) § 738) & - .
Hunter Dszpe- [natalled] S 1,366 | § - N
CLACO Supph] § 1,105 $ - -
Contract Décorf § 1971505 - - N
5 . $ -
CLACO Suppls} 50 L R
CLACO Supphd S - 5 - N
CLACO Supph] § 50] 8 - -
Siggims] § siz]s - _
Meyer] § 795 | 5 - B
5 N B .
T Comell Roofine] __ Above . 15 - »
Standard Shest Melx!l Ahove 3 - R
Jim Pluskery Above 5 + .
ASCA- Not anstallzd] 8§ 51,6101 $ - -
. I3 .
o gilet Boom Accessories: o 10880 - -CLACO Supply T
o CLACO Supph] § 28755 - - - -
Meverf § 2230
Siggincf § 2,564
Sorclla] § 8841]3% - -
DH PACE] § 20,449 | S - -
3 -

s Crdasive Asseciatos] v B
Creative Associates] S 130,250 | & - Co- -
Precision Millwork] 8 109934 5 5,500.00 -
N Clon Acphali] S 145303 § 1,300.00 -
Carol Seating} § 173243 F § 2,201.00 -
5 - 5 -
- Floor Matsand Eyames’ " 2488 e 5
---------------- T D s - Is -
% Hnter Dipe : i B
Hunter Drape] § 3.03a] 5 - -
Contract Dézor] S 3950) § - -
- 3 -
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BID DAY- TA EDISION

SPEC
SECTI

SUBCONTRACTOR]

KA

Mechanical]

BASE BID

Add Payment and
Performance Bon

Recovery
Wheel

-1,.086.00

KC3 5 1503685 -
Boss Mochumicall 5 18578338 - - - 5.574.00 .
Salagino Plumbing | 5 188788{5 - - - -2.076.00 -
s " 3 . - -
S - Javbasle Fiee Sprinkder] : s [ S
Jayhawk Fire Sprinkler] § 37260] 8 -_386.00
Alliance] § 3691118 -750.00
Apssis] § 44,2008 S - - £50.00
Ngtiosal Fire Protection] § 530661 % - - E00.00
5 - 3 PR
CHYAC. CEdivards MacDpwett] oy [ s 16,200 ]
Edwards MacDowelif § 334900 5 - 3,200.00 16,200
Midsiate Hoating end Cooling] § 345264 S 5.022.00 25,097
Motro A § 348090 8 4,535 .98 18,140
KC Mechenical] S 350,310 5 2,223.00 3.886
vic] s ss2d91fs 4.000.00 15.475
F& G Mot s 3650003 6.500.00 25,500
5 - s - -
] o

Borts Blsting; S E
Barts Electng] § TS0 | S 6,110.00 -
No bid ¢p bond S & § clectricel] 3 50000 § S 7.800.00 -
Mark One Eleciric] § £29.8951 § -7.820.00 -
Pro Circuiz] S 501,266 4 § - 6,135 00 -
MC Electricl § 5340000 5 - - - 801000 -
RFErhcr' H 563,002 ]| $ - 10.280.00 -

I < - 5 . . L
ALT#1 -
Add Payment and

Performance Bond
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BER DAY- TA EDISION

$ISF
CARRY % of Total
SPEC 22152
SECTI TOTAL contract
1& - 4,500 9635 [ 0.43 6.16%
- [] 0 $ - 0.00%
" Mgy Moduttr Clisrogm, 42070 TR Badet S0 e 2000 |5 B0 T 0.34%
~ - Sclestive Nemulition - - 02070 - Rebeueti] i EARSTS I B s 00,980 BT A b8 17 Yal
Rab 16,375 0 100950 § 4.56 1.71%
o Sit Fendng w2230 o R Dee] oL T - Below 1
Earthwerle™ -0 BB RE Danean] 0 g g R R :.180;529"-:- L8 P |
RL Dunca) . 42,538 $ 180,2301 $ 8.14 3.05%|
2230 Kaw Veilsy C - 4,100 5 188,900 | $ 8.53 3.20%
George Shaw 37,569 s 1953873 | $ 8.84 3.32%
Blue Moon Hauling] 37,750 $ 202,950] 5 9.16 3.44%
Blae Mooa Hewling / Size Liilineg| 1] k- 277,840
. moil Treatmen THEAG], oo Adscdgble Peit Coatrolf o SR e | 2800 5 B E -_.O;Q%
AfBrdable Pest Contro! 1,000 2800 ] 0.13 0.05%
Bear Services| - 1,000 3120 ] 0.14 0.05%
Lawrence Post coning! - 1,000 3500 b 0.18 0.06%
Sips Proteclion and Eriion Coptl 02370~ MLDmwli BT R Rbove [l
Erasion Cortral / Incorporated - 2 14309 $ 0,65 0.24%
SWFP Mosnizoring] [ 4800 3 0.22 0.08%
0 0 3 - 0.00%
......... _WaccDisnibafon - 9810 RERECHS o R ) 105892 1§ 77| 17e%
02510, 02530, 62630 Mcszmh‘F 16,000 105692 $ 4.77 1.79%
Rainbow Construction] - 16,000 128925.78 3 582 2.19%
Blus Moon Hauling | Sits Utilivzs! - 16,600 268840 $ 12.14 4 .55%
v - Sy Sewer 250 L MeGamaiy S0 S :Above i =
[ Srorm Draimage ARE3 i Melamale] g O T ABOVE. B ey
TS0 M Faviea] 3 o | oy Beg e A | 2.00%]
Seal-0 Matic Paving 26,809 107589 3 4.86 1.82%
Little Jocs| 0 135160 $ 6.10 2.29%
" ooz She O] e G ~Below
~ i Conteatingia Sted Ui 0 : 'ggiow.-:-._.
e g S0 gelgw-'* : R
[ Chaiy Link Fenee T OEBRE o s reed o 0% T AB207 18 009 T0.26%
US Fence - 718 15207 f 0.69 0.26%
ACME] 1,120 16515 E: 0.75 0.28%
. - 0 0 E - 0.00%
___'_________"_'__________________________;.__Q;,;_Em Curbs's Lawng i B Lo R B ¥ R TRy g 1:99 ) 0.75_%_
Curby's Lang) - - -1,950 3 44,115 199 0.75%
Green kaven Sod 8,350 5 46,500 | $ 210 0.79%)
Arbor Masteq 9,850 [ 56,770 | $ 2.56 0.96%
. Lawns sad Grasses 02920 R A o - Above]
|- -Elne Girnding and Fertliging = - 02938 izi Ctty's Lawnf 2 0 Zi.Above
-2 .- Modular Reininine Wl W oo B Hardscamesh R g R 244790 % .09 0.41%
BS Herdscopes 3,884 24178.56 1.09 041%
0 0 - 0.00%
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lBlD DAY- TA EDISION

CONCRETE SUPPLY

ALT#12 [Changes

c BeloW

$/SF

22152

% of Total
coniract

T & D MasorryE

470,60

o e ed o OR300 Gobrg Shine I KO Tonofen b o] ARRAst [ S Popa ) 897%
CGeorpe Shaw / KCG - - 285,026 4B8131 $ 22.04 8.27%|
Iniee Construction) - - 41,445 492273 3 22.22 8.34%
13 Marliny . - 31,151 515351 $ 23.28 8.73%
Leaveon - - 0 £56500 $ 25.14 8.44%
___________ Conrele Behar TTOAIR0 T Cartur Waren A0 o D T O R e R U Ty e T T
Midwest Steel Fabricators 38 Tong| - - 1,500 47308 5 2.14 0.80%
Midwest - Reinforciag WWE - -
Midwest - Rexnforemg Masonzy - -
Carter Waters 50 tong| - - 1,500 51846 $ 2.34 0.88%
CW- Reinforcing! WWE - - 2,500 32361 5 1.46 0.55%
W Reinforcing Masorry| - - 2,500 22885 3 1.04 0.38%
CGerday 55 1oy - - 1,500 57361 3 2.5% G.97%
o Sonerete Rebar Rastall -+ -+ 03300 201 Gotrge Sha AKEGE T Lo Above - H
B - [ 0 - 0.00%
__,.,,,;,:.,‘,,.,‘,,‘,.,____.__._._--._._-..---._.":ﬂ.ggﬁ: il Qmepa Qe Systems} i o SRR 29M0 B B 13'27 e 4‘980
Omega Conctets Systems - - 0 293300 fi 13.27 4.98%
Cors Slab Stmucrres| B - 0 347852 15.71 5.80%
o =

18,300

7.9
7.95%

I & D Masory} - - 470600 21.24
Tust FarTon - - 44,300 522438 3 23.58 8.85%
MGM Masoan] - - 19,300 419566 3 23.45 8.81%
TRI STATE MASONRY| - - 19,300 538230 ] 24.30 9.72%|
Sumzmit Masonry| - - 19,300 545800 L 24.54 9.25%
Precision Masonry 508105 B 22.84 8.61%
Tris Mascsny 558000 3 25.1% 0,.46%

[]
i T & D Masoanyg i R ES " e Ry B

Cositeiniasié] Steed 37 0.000: .
Contentintial Stes! 370000 } .
Daing Stecl Fabrication) No Bid 373878 5 16.88 6.34%
Struceral Metal of KC| -33.000 3B0600 5 17.18 5.45%
Kansas city Strucrral - No Bid 382217 3 17.26 6.48%
Builders Stee] - 29,000 420748 3 18.99 7.13%
Lico Stesl - -36,000 428500 3 19.35 7.26%
o BSaR0 -2 Conentietial Sea] o000 g g R s Aoyl : By
4 0 5 - 0.00%
. Steel Peck:” 95310 Vo ontonmtind Swel] R R R B Y Tt Ak L
""" 0 [ 5 - 0.00%
- 5:_ T Ton Comml o orge T THBolow | —
[ 0 5 - 0.00%
“-DESND - Kelly Construvton Grugpl.— o o CRERER [ i R
Siggins - - [ 284 $ 0.01 0.00%
Mays Maund] - - [} 985 $ 0.04 0.02%
In Pro} - - 0 250 3 0.01
B B 0 0 3 -
[ [ 3 -
Kty Cans i Grong : 3

4SIGHT] - - [ [ [ - 0.00%
Kellv Construction Giroup) - - o 45,607 206 0.77%
[ [ i - 0.00%)|
v Kelly Cozatnictics Group) 11 o 0 L 29,698 1S R4 0:50%
Keily constnuclion Group - - '] 29,658 { I 1.34 0,50%
- - ] 0 g - 0.00%
[ 0 E - 0.60%
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lBlD UAY- TA EDMSION

7 |changes

CARRY

$ISF

22152

% of Total
contracl

% ; 3
i Appied Merkrane Alr ByTars G105, - ot o Loas e e T A0 g8 S T T 8h ) 06a5%)
17195, 07920, 07840, 02764 Jacor] - 4.500 - 1,500 40934 3 1.85 0.69%
7920,7196, 03764 DH Restoration] - 5,500 - 3,500 40511 3 183 0.69%
7920.719 Larkin) - 4,250 - 3,500 45805 E] 211 0.79%
[ $
;i Buildine Fossdation: 07200 R G L0 L S % R
T 0 $
“DELAAf: o B E 0 i oo
[ 3
i DELTA g g s s o S : :
DELTA . - 18.753 84,554 450762 3 20.50 7.81%
07482, 0751 3,07620, 07720 KAW| - - 8,530 0 487905 $ 2203 8.27%
07412, 0751507620, B7720 Comell Roofing| - - -2,300 a 601235 $ 27.14 10.19%
[] [ 5 - 0.00%|
83629 S DELTAC R L6 DRI IR SAboves T
DELTA - - - 0 [} b - 0.0026,
KAW. - - - 0 0 ] - 0.00%
Comell Roofizg] - - - 0 0 ) - 0.00%
07412, 076 Shawhan - - - [ 118956 5.37 2.02%
07412, 67620, L0705 Standard Sheet Metal - - - 0 244886 11.06 4.15%
[1] [] - 0.00%
T Rl Atcewar TR YR e v o o TTABOVe - T
[T Reof Scuttle DELTA - - - 0 AVALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE!
Roof Hatch KAW] - - - 0 #VALUEI #VALUE! #VALUE!
Ladder Safety Post Comell Roofing] - - - o #VALUEI #VALUE! HVALUE!
Griffin Sales - - - 0 2%33 $ 0.10 0.04%
Ezton and Ass0ciaos: [] 639 $ 0.07 0.03%
" S Taeee] L RV 0 ENER Abovg R L
0 0 ] - 0.00%
R RS S R coinnnn R Ao ;
Larkin] 2,393 - 0 [ 3 - 0.00%
Charsberlinf - 350 - 0 37243 ] 1.68 0.63%
Conumercial W - - - [ 40539 % 1.83 0.689%
DH Restoration - - [} 0 3 - 0.00%
- [] 0 $ - 0.00%
| ;- Hollow Metal Doors apgd Erames” - 88 " O Dagd 0 i S 84,539 1§ - ():02%
Oriega Doo] 1214 + - 7,404 5 54520 § 0.92%
08100, 0% DH Paet] 620 - - 5,000 $ 56115 § § .95%
28100,.08210, 02710 Metel Doors_and Frames| 1,000 - - 5,000 5 £9,6461 5 1.01%
[ [ 3 - 0.00%
o Jim Plunkiord g O S st Ralgw] e o
] 0 3 - 0.00%]
#  Orega Door) U s NN o s Alove i R e
o [ K - O.00%
i = Eatrg torefront . 05408 . - e Pluzker] BRI e i L : 159;g§7._. j 764
08130, 08400,08510,08500. 10705 Jint Plasheu - - - 14,714 169267 3 7.64 2.87%
3 510.0 0 5 Miduwest Glass - - - 5,000 170885 3 7.71 2.80%
k! 0 0705 Carter Glass| - - - 4,000 249524 3 11.26 4.23%
o 0 $ - 0.00%)
o A liaee Yindows - Lo QRO S Tom Phinkend R HE B o B AbOVg T R = T
[ 0 5 -
o QRTL O Do e RS 0 o Apoyepes
0 0 $ -
2 i Tlisdieia] 5577 0 G : soAboveo]i

__________ 3 2 ! 121,983 1
05400, 07200, 05260, 08500 Joc Coons| 16,491 - - 121983 551 2,.07%|
07, 60, 09500 Allied Constrattion Seritd 18,950 - - 5,000 205485 E 9.28 3.48%
06 5 45ight No Bid - - 5,000 379775 $ 17.14 6.44%|
0 ] ] - 0.00%
D950 - Tos Coons| Y BN 0 N [ § SRR i
'_""___ [ 1] 3 - 0.00%
< HO6E i Campet 100 - 3.000 g 0 72680 S 328 1230&1
00650, Carpet 1 33 000 - - [ 72680 E 3.28 1.23%
- - - o 0 ] - 0.00%
— 2 ] 3 - 0.00%
T el Tleerand Corsi s 00 Teoy oty St SN EONa R ISR SRR 15965 |5 0771 027l
Epoxy Coating Surfoces) - - - ] 15985 0.72 0.27%
Desce Contings| - - - [ 22038 1.04 0.39%|
_ 0 0 - G.00%
Caznet o GOEg S Campetid]- "0 D Lo s Ahove = - RS
0 0 - 0.00%
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BID BAY-TA EDISION

i7:|Changes

BISF

22152

% of Total
cantract

Novawall] . [ 5934 $
0 0 g - 0.00%;
Daigtizg - T e Asocal B T 3T A0 s ee T 063%
Switzer and Associates 5,500 2,500 ar1o E 1.68 0.63%
{Lass Counry 10,276 3,450 37207 S 1.68 0.63%
AT SWITZER! 7.870 0 40215 3 1.82 0.68%
Dayeo Painsizy 10,460 0 45350 ] 2.05 0.77%
ccxmﬁl 5,790 o 45835 3 211 0.79%
[ 0 b - 0.00%)]

"LACO Supplv 3 TGTAL) 5
CLACO Sepply - 0 ] 5 - 0.00%
CLACO Supply 3 TOTAL - 945 4790 g 0.22 0.08%;
Sipgins2 lotal - 1,600 4800 $ 0.22 0.08%
0 0 3 - 0.00%|
- Markers sed Tack board: 18109 B B R s -g:550: § ()44 (3.16_0&
CLACO Supply] - 1]
Siggins} - 375 9850 $ 044 0.16%
Flatirun) - [} GHEE 044 0.16%
Meyer] - [ 12675 0.57 0.21%
Midwest Acoustics - a 25425 1.15 0.43%
Sorclia - 0 32830 E: 1.48 0.56%
[ [] E - 0.00%:
e Pariitns Seld Polvmer) - 10170 L Bpgas ol B LiTBAS 2035 (RERA
CLACO Supphy] - 0 1] - 0.00%
Sipgins- Tnzmiled) . o 7643 0.35 0.13%;
Meyer- Instabiod] - 0 7914 3 0.36 0.13%%
Soreltar - 1] 8659 5 0.39 0.15%
CLACO Supply- Laszalied] - 3,500 9320 E 0.42 0.16%;
Zazies- Not installed - 3,500 2370 ] 042 0.16%
M] Products- ingialled - 3,500 9630 3 043 0.16%
0 0 3 - 0.00%
- Cabicle Curtain Trag ERRR LA L 11 i iabing Q7 B -"'1'.28_8:'---3 g K 06§ .0_02%
CLACO Supph] - [ 0 8 - 0.00%
Sipaing - 550 1288 $ 0.06 0.02%
Henter Drape- - a 1366 3 0.06 0.02%
CLACO Supply - 550 1655 ] 0.07 0.03%
Contract Décor] - 0 185¥5 3 0.09 0.03%
0 [ 3; - 0.00%
T CLACT S| ST ) 590 IS 0.03) - 001%
CLACO Sepph - 0 [ 3 - 0.00%
CLACO Sepply - [i 591 3 0.03 0.01%
Sipgins - o £12 $ 0.03 0.01%
Mayer] - ] 785 $ Q.04 0.01%,
0 0 § - 0.00%|
L A0703 <o i Phanbiens 0 R —Above - S
Comell Roofing) - Q
Standard Shest Meta) - ]
Jim Plunkety] - Q
ASCA- Nt -ingialied - 0 51610 5 2.33 0.87%
0 [ 5 - 0.009%]
- Eond Roem Aceegionien ;. AR TGRSR 0 EECER B 275 ] 0. 045
CLACO Supply - [i] 2175 E] 0.10 0.04%
Meya ] 2230 $ Q.10 0.04%
Sigging ] 2564 3 0.12 0.04%
Sorelly - [] 8841 [ 0.40 0.15%
DH PACE] - [ 90449 $ 4.08 1.53%
[ 3
- Craanive Associatis B
Creative Azsotistes - 5,300 114750 [ 5.18 1.94%;
Pretasion Miliwork] - [} 115434 5 5.21 1.56%
: Gion Agphaty - 0 146683 5 6.62 2.49%
Carol Scating| . Q 175444 $ 792 2.87%
0 [1] ] - 0.00%:!
(22 N Showiz| I I N bid
0 [ 3 - 0.00%
+ 17 Hunter Deapel - g TR IR I & o] 38 .14 0.05%
Hunice Drape] - 0 3030 ] 0.14 0.05%
Contract Déco - o 3850 g Q.18 0.07%
I 0 0 3 - 0 00%
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!B[l) DAY- T A EDISION

SPEC
SECTI

13 KO Mechanical

SUBCONTRACTOR):

12:|Chranges

161,434

$ISF

221562

% of Total
contract

K Mechanical - - 161434 3 7.29 2.74%
Bess Mechanical - - 173587 g 7.84 2.94%
Selnding Phumbing - - 184364 § 8.32 3.12%
_ 9 g - 0.00%
;o:-Fire Protectigg’© 3 iy - Tayhawk Fire Spraklee 0000 S BRE 37620 % 170 “0.BA%
JTaykawk Fira | - Q 37620 3 1.70 0.64%]
Alliarce - 0 37661 5 1.70 0.64%
Agests - 0 44850 ] 2.02 0.76%
Netional Firg P - 0 54560 B 2.48 0.52%,
[] 0 E - 0.00%}
HVAC: .- Edwards MasBowetlf - 7,300 0 [0 0 0 | 34RB00 ? e 5.81%
Edwards MacDowsll| 7,300 No Bid - 10,500 s 348,600 15.74 5.91%
Midstaiz Heating and Coolin 6,850 10,120 - 7,500 B 357,786 § 16.15 6.06%
Meto Ai] 7,525 10,120 . 7,000 5 360,536] § 16.28 &8.11%]
KC Mochanical] 7,180 No Bid - 7,080 $ 369,533 $ 16.68 6.26%|
VEC]  7.234 No Bid - 7,000 $ 373,401| § 16.86 5.33%
F & G Mochanical] 7,500 No Big - 7,000 $ 378,500 | 17.09 6.42%)
- - - 0 0 E] - 0.00%
[ 0 E - 0.00%
Bimts Flsotris
Bents Elonng]  No big - - 5,400 462260 S 20.87 7.83%
No bid on bengd 5& S clootrical]l  No big - - 31,700 498500 3 22.10 8.30%
Mark One Electie] 1000 - - 52,050 A957ES 5 22.38 5.40%
ProCircentf  No bid - - o 517401 ki 23.36 8.77%|
MC Electic] 1,455 - - 0 542010 § 24.47 9.19%)
RF Fisher] 728 - - [} 573382 E 25.88 9.72%
(] 0 $ - 000%
$ 18,753
ALT#12 31Changes SISF
CARRY of Total
TOTAL 22152 contract






